
OpenCycle
Santa Monica 4.7 (134)2.4 mi

1 intro offer yoga meditation pilates nutrition strength training

Balance Yoga Studio
Santa Monica 4.2 (203)1.8 mi

1 intro offer yoga meditation pilates nutrition strength training

Fitness Los Angeles, CA

Activities Businesses

Categories Time Date Distance

Go with the flow,  
Andrew.

Book a favorite

Circa Moveme...

452 East 14th St

The Loop

1247 San Pablo B...

Luna Wellness...

3698 Madison

Upcoming (5)

Mon

16
April

4:15pm EST (60 min)

60 minutes Personal Training

w/ Melissa at Enzo Fit Midtown NYC

Offers for first-time clients

$39 intro offer

28 Day Program - 
Intro to Circa
Circa Movement - NYC

2.1 mi 4.3 (43)

Near you

View Map

Based on your past bookings

Mon 4/6 at 4:20pm

Beginners Yoga

The Yoga Spot

today

Tue 4/7 at 5:30pm

Tai Chi in the Cour...

Havens Healing Center

tomorrow

Thu 4/9 at 12:00pm

Meditation and Br...

The Yoga Spot

Price drop

Mon 4/6 at 7:00am

Beginners Yoga

$8 $10 20% off

today

Mon 4/6 at 8:20am

Beginners Yoga

$15 $20 25% off

today

Mon 4/6 at 12:00pm

Beginners Yoga

$16

Deals near you

Almost sold out

Mon 4/6 at 7:00am

Breathwork for Be...

$25

today

Mon 4/6 at 8:20am

Barre Basics

$22

today

Mon 4/6 at 12:00pm

Beginners Yoga

$16

Spas to treat yourself

The Brainery

2 intro offers facials massage

2.1 mi 4.3 (43)

Inspiration for your next workout

Relaxation Flexibility

Home Search Favorites Deals Profile

Services & Products > Select Classes or 
Appointments > Click on Service Name > 

Select Category > Save

Running on the classic Mindbody platform? 

Start on the page. Services & Pricing

For virtual offerings, use the word “VIRTUAL” in all 
caps before the title so it’s easy for anyone to find it, 
wherever they might be (i.e., “VIRTUAL HIIT”).

Intro Offers

Attract new clients.

Stand out on the Mindbody app and give potential 
customers an extra nudge to commit by promoting 
your intro offers. 

Mindbody app dashboard > Promoted Intro Offers 
> Toggle On > Manage > Select Pricing Option > 

Enable Promote in Mindbody app > Save

Keywords & Categories

Help customers find your business. 

Create class, service, and location descriptions full of 
relevant keywords to help clients discover your 
business and your offerings. Make sure to use 
keywords that accurately describe your business so it 
will pop up when someone is searching.

Marketplace app dashboard > Edit App Listing > 
Select Location > Location Description

Remove the guesswork with concise, yet descriptive 
class and service titles. Make sure that you select 
correct Categories and Sub-Categories for accurate 
filter results. 

Photos

Showcase your brand.

Choose a minimum of 6 photos that accurately 
represent the classes, appointments and services you 
provide. Make sure to use high-quality photography—
first impressions matter! 

Mindbody app dashboard > Edit App Listing > 
Location 1 > Manage Location Photos

Have multiple locations?

Just select a location from the filter on the Add 
Photos screen to add photos for each of your studios. 

The Mindbody App Checklist
More new clients. More revenue.

Optimize your Mindbody app listing with these simple steps. 

https://support.mindbodyonline.com/s/article/Your-Services-Pricing-menu?language=en_US
https://support.mindbodyonline.com/s/article/MB-app-hub?language=en_US


Ratings & Reviews

Boost your stars.

Encourage customers to leave ratings for your class
after their visit and even respond to customers
directly via the Ratings & Reviews Report.

Learn more about the Ratings & Reviews report. 

PrerEquisites & Equipment Needed

Inform your clients before they arrive. 

Make sure clients are prepared to have the best
experience at your business by letting them know
exactly what to bring or what prerequisites are
required.

Services & Products > Select Classes > Click on class
name > Additional Options > Prerequisites Options

Running on the classic Mindbody platform?
Start on the page. Services & Pricing

Dynamic Pricing

Fill unsold spots. 

Fill classes with a discount or charge extra for last-
minute spots during peak hours. Dynamic Pricing
classes get premium placement in the Mindbody app
for greater visibility.

Mindbody app > Dynamic Pricing > Toggle On >
Manage

The Mindbody App Checklist

https://support.mindbodyonline.com/s/article/203256933-Ratings-and-Reviews-report-MINDBODY-app?language=en_US
https://support.mindbodyonline.com/s/article/Your-Services-Pricing-menu?language=en_US



